
1W Ro 1te7o-33004/99 REGD.NO.D.L-33004/99   

/lift

Maria
The Gatette of ;India

EXTRAORDINARY

*I* II—Vrtrr 3-71T-Iin (0
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (1)

lurentat r1 1rETItT8
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

*. 3871events, 'VII 9, 2010/3WITT 18, 1932
No. 3871	 NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, JULY 9, 2010/ASADHA 18, 1932

	  33417	 frft <aim thi

aftrit

qt Icrkil, 9 /M,2010

*TATA	 	  atK An* mitki
itiPigi lmt47 Wit aftlfit1R, 2006 (2006 *,T 19) *1 WM 61 ART
STC7 711VRIi TT 'sr* *Ta Viirertrit 3i1t 9r-t-rw fri;
fg tig lH	 TdCgRi *MR afr(	 q
.41-4 (a *TT 41g4CW *OA, fiat )rentli 7:11fgta lt
Thr4* fug Tuftiv wer) fi1igH, 2008 4"{:4914q *74 *

fq‘ifiirtia fqfiqq crud( *, WITiff: :—

1. (1) ri ittriiR1 r-ezttr aft Ar-t-r-dw iltf ItiiReF
Wit (3ITOW *C1 *ram 1.1014, 1 3•1 ur,
**RIR colk*%R 3firW IK-11)**9 tr.4W4/
2010 *V 	  I

(2) W IR*Ri totml x1 3774	 *1. cut	  * A-19.

2.tr.-eg9 AK RS '1/44fg rig lMgT t Csa
f0 Ingticm-r "1;4014, 	 mlirm * fat-cut *-tf * Mg
saftv *790 fqPiqq, 2008 IL-

(*)iq	5 tzg-fqr:v4,4 (8) 11"Tird fcq " Tgl*

wri ITT "Q-w 4r *4 kg " ArK filizilltict fwg

(Wi) *NWT' 10 *34-149414 (3) * 	 ti
4 Mtn *ig, qifid: :—

2630 G1/2010	 (I)

"(3) 	 4 11*-t*I7g-fq	  (1)* qin	  qi
*TR 7114 71 wish VFM	 *43Irga	 It* *RI
*-4*10faisc4w*.itamft101*-1arerrg***
sr94 *Ire

(4) 14144 it9* .a4-14riqg (4) 4 "wth fcq"
-4*Tzrtq w "kw 4i weft ft q"	 5rfret641

fw1Z wit

( ig ) iciri<04 14	 	 ( ) *W (w), (w)
att (To *Mg frikirsq 1+fatql1441*-4t

"(*) 95	 t CUR :

(0 "Stra #R* an* GA* .R44* Tcr vtora
r**t	 * Mg Clauc-r *1-4	 4ftr ;r4

cRicf;

00 Miqzra ch -411***Tit cilft	 * CR 3rfavr4
aiftrw war vrrrgrff mw*1 vu* Cmg lally-r

Afr V. -dumit! AfffS18;

SITC* frfi leV3189. 	9. rfa* */MR
sifeRict	 *I	 *Mg itHisi %dr
wl trftr *I 44114 sredru

(a) 	 v*Mg :

(D	 *R* WIMP' * Taft 'rim*	 vim
1*• *Mg lolly( *4*1	 wr *a

3reorn;



2	 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY
	

[PART II—SEc. 3(i)]

(ii) Nitta clq, fril* TIFTT6ff * cu	 Cam' i*Wg 3Finff

t 45mi:ram srratraw*1 v*faTtiscrrli
Aig i Trfsr a 1 area srf-drff;

irr-cf-d* li * trftarn * q1144) 444 * vita
facer t aTfliw ww*-1. 	*fm '0415-1

T1 a Thl trITI4 'AM;

(T) 7*-V*1.01Z
fti^lwr airT1 ltfrtWr1tt41Afd3Ta"

[TR. 4. 74-51xliwrav8n010]
rd9. t. tra4,

itttraft.--r fa iqii • 	 34001), 5 =t)

6, WI 2008 V1 afeird ft-oz ./T.4u to aft
Clvtl YtlItt Pi4	 80200 , Ic'iit
19 9-dizal, 2008 7E11 TIT.W.fff. 769(31),
fciia+ 20 444c1 sit, 2009 "gRT old fait
flit to I

PETROLEUM AND NATURAL GAS

REGULAROTY BOARD

NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 9th July, 2010

G.S.R. 594(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred
by Section 61 of the Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory
Board Act, 2006 (19 of 2006), the Petroleum and Natural
Gas Regulatory Board hereby makes the following
regulations to amend the Petroleum and Natural Gas
Regulatory Board (Authorizing Entities to Lay, Build,
Operate or Expand Natural Gas Pipelines) Regulations, 2008,
namely:-
1. (1) These regulations may be called the Petroleum

and Natural Gas Regulatory Board (Authorizing
Entities to Lay, Build, Operate or Expand Natural
Gas Pipelines) Amendment Regulations, 2010.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their
publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory Board
(Authorizing Entities to Lay, Build, Operate or Expand
Natural Gas Pipelines) Regulations, 2008,-

(a) in sub-regulation (8) of regualation 5, for the words
"sixty days", the words "one hundred and twenty
days" shall be substituted;

for sub-regulation (3) of regualation 10, the
following shall be substituted, namely :—

"(3) the entity shall submit Heads of Agreement or
Memorandum of Understanding or both specified
under sub-regulation (1) to the Board within a
period of one hundred and eighty days of the
date of issue of the authorisation";

in sub-regulation (4) ofregulation 10, for the words
"one hundred and twenty days", the words "one
hundred and eighty days" shall be substituted;

(d) for clauses (a), (b) and (c) of sub-regulation 1 of
regulation 14, the following shall be substituted,
namely :—

"(a) for the first default :

ten per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default up to ten per cent of annual
target of transporting natural gas;
twenty per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default up to fifty per cent above ten
per cent of annual target of transporting natural
gas;

(ih) twenty five per cent of the amount of the
performance bond for the default above fifty per
cent of annual target of transporting natural gas;

for the second default :

twenty per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default up to ten per cent of annual
target of transporting natural gas;

01) forty per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default up to fifty per cent above ten
per cent of annual target of transporting natural
gas;
fifty per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default above fifty per cent of annual
target of transporting natural gas;
for the third default :
one hundred per cent of the amount of the
performance bond".

[F. No. S-AdmnJIII8/2010]
RATAN P. WATAL, Secy.

Foot note.—Principal regulations were notified vide
No. G.S.R. 340(E), dated 6th May, 2008 and
subsequently amended vide G.S.R. 802(E),
dated 19th November, 2008 and G.S.R. 769(E),
dated 20th October, 2009.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.


	Page 1
	Page 2

